












Invoice No: 1043626
Date: May 15,2013
Engagement #; 0036278-0002

DATE
05/13/13

STAFF
T. Stewart

SERVICE
4/30/13 quarterly court report;
research Wells Fargo note
balances on Wilderness and
Apple Blossom, prepare
spreadsheet and open items for
differences
Enter invoices, print checks,
copy, assemble for signature,
mail
4130113 court report; Wilderness
and Apple Blossom loan balance
adjustments

HRS
7.75

RATE
135.00

AMOUNT
1,046.25

05/14/13 T. Stewart 1.00 135.00 135.00

05115/13 T. Stewart 2.00 135.00 270.00

Total Services 3,734.55

Subtotal for engagement 0036278-0002 $3.734,55

SERVICES DETAIL

Select Asset Fu.nd I: 0036278-0006

DATE STAFF SERViCE HRS RATE AMOUNT
04/17/13 C. Parsons April, 2013: update banking 0.25 135.00 33.75

activity
05/06(13 C. Parsons April, 2013: bank reconciliation, 0.75 135.00 101.25

general ledger adjustments,
prepare support workpapers

Total Services 135.00

Subtotal for engagement 0036278-0006 $135.QO

SERVICES DETAIL

Select Asset Prime Index Fund: 0036278~0007

DATE STAFF SERVICE HRS RATE AMOUNT
04/17/13 C. Parsons April, 2013: update banking 0.25 135.00 33.75

activity
05106113 C. Parsons April,2013: bank reconciliation, 0.75 135.00 101.25

general ledger adjustments,
prepare support workpapers

Total Services 135.00

Subtotal for engagement 003627~0007 $135.00

Case 4:11-cv-02830   Document 158-4   Filed in TXSD on 09/20/13   Page 7 of 32



UHY Advisors TX. LLC
2929 Allen Parkway, 20"' Floor
Houston, Texas 77019-7100

Phone: 713-960-1706
Toll Free: 800-949-1706
Web: www.uhy-us.com

Steven A_ Harr
Receiver
700 Louisiana Street, Suite 4600
Houston, Texas 77002-2845

Invoice No: 1043629
'. Date: May 15,2013

Engagement #: 0036278-0008
0036278-0009

INVOICE

RE: J. David Financial Group et al "Tax Services"

Professional services rendered in connection with J. David Group et al receivership for the period
April 16, 2013 to May 15,2013

(See Attached Detail)

Total Amount Due This Invoice ==,""$~2",3~5",,.9~Q

SUMMARY BY ENGAGEMENT (PROJECT)

Engagement # Engagement N arne
-------

Amount

Select Asset Fund I

$123.15

$112.15

0036218-0008

0036218-0009

Select Asset Prime Index Fund

WIRING INSTRUCTIONS:
UHY Advisors, Inc.
Charter One Bank I RBS Citizens Bank.
5505 N. Cumberland Ave., Suite 307 - Chicago, IL 60656-1471
Account Number: 4516302380
ABA: 241070417
Swift Number for International Wires: CTZIUS33

REMITTANCE ADDRESS
UHY Advisors TX, LLC
Dept CH16401
Palatine, IL 60055-6401

Place your engagement number on your check >I< Our Federal Tax l.D. # is 76-0522558
This invoice may be kept for your records -- Thank you

Case 4:11-cv-02830   Document 158-4   Filed in TXSD on 09/20/13   Page 8 of 32

http://www.uhy-us.com


SERVICES DETAIL

Select Asset Prime Index Fund: 0036278-0008

DATE STAFF SERVICE HRS RATE AMOUNT

05/07/13 A.Hume Emails with L Waters re: status of 0.05 300.00 15.00
2013 TFTR

05/08/13 S. Pennington 2012 TFTR EXTENSION 0.50 145.00 72.50
PREPARATION

05/09/13 S. Pennington 2012 Extension preparation: 0.25 145.00 36.25
updated after Lacy reviewed

Total Services 123.75

Subtotal for engagement 0036278-0008

SERVICES DETAIL

Select Asset Fund I: 0036278-0009

DATE STAFF SERVICE HRS RATE AMOUNT

05/07113 A.Hume Emails with L Waters re: status of 0.05 300.00 15.00
2013 TFTR

05/08/13 S. Pennington 2012 TFTR EXTENSION 0.50 145.00 72.50
PREPARATION

05/09113 S. Pennington 2012 TFTR extension 0.17 145.00 24.65
preparation: updated after L
Waters reveiwed

Total Services 1I2.IS

Subtotal for engagement 0036278-0009 $1n.15
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UHY Advisors FLVS, Inc. 2929 Allen Parkway, 20'" Floor
Houston, Texas 77019-7100

Phone: 7\3-960-1706
Toll Free: 800-949-1706
Web: www.uhy-us.corn

Mr. Steven Harr, Receiver
Munsch Hardt Kopf & Harr PC
700 Louisiana Street, Suite 4600
Houston, Texas 77002

Invoice No: 1047002
Date: June 15,2013

Engagement #: 0036278-0001
003 6? 78-0004

INVOICE

RE: J. David Financial Group et al

Professional services rendered in connection with J. David Financial Group receivership for the
period May 16,2013 to June 15,2013

(See Attached Detail)

Total Amount Due This Invoice ~ $1,41.i1QQ

SUMMARY BY ENGAGEMENT (PROJECT)

Engagement # Name Amount

0036278-0001

0036278-0004

J. David Financial Group et al

Select Asset Fund I

$1,425.00

$45.00

WIRING INSTRUCTIONS:
DRY Advisors, Inc.
Charter One Eank I RBS Citizens Bank
5505 N. Cumberland Ave., Suite 307 - Chicago, IL 60656-1471
Account Number: 4516302380
AEA: 241070417
Swift Number for International Wires: CTZIUS33

REMITTANCE ADDRESS
DRY Advisors FLVS, Inc.
Dept. CHl6401
Palatine, IL 60055-6401

Place your engagement number on your check * Our Federal Tax J.D. # is 20-2703059
This invoice may be kept for your records -- Thank you
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Invoice No: 1047002
Date: June 15,2013
Engagement #: 0036278-0001

SERVICES DETAIL

J. David Group: 0036278-0001

DATE STAFF SERVICE HRS RATE AMOUNT

05116/13 J. Daves Respond to questions regarding 0.45 300.00 135.00
Wells Fargo loan for house sale.

05/17/13 J. Daves Review of invoices and 0.30 300.00 90.00
coordination of payments.

05/17/13 J. Daves Correspondence with Wells 0.65 300.00 195.00
Fargo regarding reconciliation of
notes due.

OS/21/13 1. Daves Correspondence with team and 0.20 300.00 60.00
counsel regarding quarterly
report.

OS/22!l3 J. Daves Review of invoices and 0.30 300.00 90.00
coordination of payment.

OS/23/13 J. Daves Prepare wires for payments. 0.25 300.00 75.00

05/28113 J. Daves Review of invoices and 0.25 300.00 75.00
coordination of payment.

OS/29113 1. Daves Correspondence with accounting 0.15 300.00 45.00
team regarding loan payoffs.

05/30/13 1. Daves Review of quarterly report and 0.75 300.00 225.00
discussion with accounting team
regarding same.

06/05/13 J. Daves Review of monthly cash report. 0.25 300.00 75.00

06/07/13 J. Woods Wire transfers for MH 1.20 300.00 360.00

Total Services 1,425.00

Subtotal for engagement 0036218--0001 $~,41S,Ql1

SERVICES DETAIL-0004

Select Asset Fund I: 0036278-0004

DATE

05/21113

STAFF

J. Daves

SERVICE

Research payment status for
Pacific Northwest loan.

HRS

0.15

RATE

300.00

AMOUNT

45.00

Total Services 45.00

Subtotal for engagement 0036278--0004 $45.00
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UHY Advisors FL VS; Inc. 2929 Allen Parkway, 20" Floor
Houston, Texas ·77019-7100

Phone: 713-960- [706
Toll Free: 800-949-1706
Web: www.uhy-us.com

Mr. Steven Harr, Receiver
Munsch Hardt Kopf & Harr PC
700 Louisiana Street, Suite 4600
Houston, Texas 77002

Invoice No; 1047003
Date: June 15,2013

Engagement #: 0036278-0002
0036278-0006
0036278-0007

INVOICE

RE: J. David Financial Group et al "Bookkeeping Services"

Professional services rendered in connection with 1. David Group et al receivership for the period
May 16,2013 to June 15,2013

(See Attached Detail)

Total Amount Due This Invoice $7,101.45

SUMMARY BY ENGAGEMENT (PROJECT)

Engagement # Engagement Name Amount

0036278-0002

0036278-0006

0036278~OOO7

J. David Financial Group et al

Select Asset Fund I

$6,920.55

$90.45

$90.45Select Asset Prime Index Fund

WIRING INSTRUCTIONS:
URY Advisors, Inc.
Charter One Bank I RBS Citizens Blink
5505 N. Cumberland Ave., Suite 307 - Chicago, IL 60656-1471
Account Number: 4516302380
ABA: 241070417
Swift Number fill' Interuational Wires; CTZmS33

REMlTTANCEADDRESS
UHY Advisors FLVS, Inc.
Dept. CHl6401
Palatine, IL 60055-6401

Place your engagement number on your check * Our Federal Tax l.D. # is 20-2703059
This invoice may be kept for your records -- Thank you
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Invoice No: 1047003
Date: June 15,2013
Engagement #: 0036278-0002

SERVICES DETAIL

J. David Group: 0036278-0002

DATE STAFF SERVICE HRS RATE AMOUNT

05116/13 A.Hume Go over correspondence with 0.60 300.00 180.00
Wells Fargo and review
reconciliation of Wilderness and
Apple Blossom loans prepared by
T Stewart; recheck updated
information from bank; status
email to J Daves

05/16113 T. Stewart TIC J Daves re: Wells Fargo loan 3.75 135.00 506.25
balances, meet w/A Hume to
discuss, update UHY prepared
loan spreadsheets; research
differences for Apple Blossom
loan payments

05/17113 T. Stewart Enter invoice to be paid, print 0.33 135.00 44.55
check, copy, assemble for
signature, mail

05/20/13 T. Stewart 4130/13 court report 3.00 135.00 405.00

OS/21113 T. Stewart Research Pacific NW Univ loan 0.25 135.00 33.75
payoff

OS/22/13 C. Wilder Standardized fund accounting 1.25 225.00 281.25
report for period ended April 30,
20] 3 - detail review (determine
why equity rollforward doesn't
roll)

OS/23/13 A.Hume QE 4/30/13 court report: Assist C 0.35 300.00 105.00
Wilder with questions regarding
classification of various income
and disbursements

05/23/13 T. Stewart 4/30/13 court report 7.25 135.00 978.75

OS/23/13 C. Wilder Standardized fund accounting 3.75 225.00 843.75
report for period ended April 30,
2013 - detail review (determine
why equity rollforward doesn't
roU) - discuss rln with Theresa &
Amy

OS/24/13 A.Hurne QE 4/30/13 court report: Assist T 0.25 300.00 75.00
Stewart with reversing accrual to
cash entry for prepaid expenses

OS/24113 T. Stewart 4/30/13 court report 2.00 135.00 270.00

OS/28/13 T. Stewart 4/30/] 3 Quarterly report; tic's w/] 5.25 135.00 708.75
Daves; enter invoices to be paid,
print checks, copy, assemble for
signature
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Invoice No: 1047003
Date: June 15, 2013
Engagement #: 0036278-0002

DATE STAFF SERVICE HRS RATE AMOUNT

05/28/13 C. Wilder Standardized fund accounting 3.85 225.00 866.25
report for period ended 4/3012013
- detail review; discuss r/n with
Theresa

OS/29/13 A.Hume Court report for QE 4/30/13: 0.75 300.00 225.00
Technical review of report; insert
links for report and schedules;
discuss with C Wilder

OS/29/13 T. Stewart Enter invoices to be paid, print l.00 135.00 135.00
checks, copy, assemble for
signature; balance intercompany
accounts; 4/30/13 court report

OS/29113 C. Wilder Standardized fund accounting 0.50 225.00 112.50
report for period ended 4/30/2013
- Report

05/30/13 T. Stewart 4/30113 court report 0.17 135.00 22.95
05130113 T. Stewart 4130113 court report l.00 135.00 135.00

05130/13 C. Wilder Standardized fund accounting 1.75 225.00 393.75
report for period ended 4/30/2013
- discuss with Theresa and Jesse
life insurance proceeds and
settlement - reclassifications

06/03/13 T. Stewart Prepare June recap of 1.25 135.00 168.75
receivership report

06/04/13 T. Stewart Enter invoices to be paid, print 0.60 135.00 81.00
checks, copy, assemble for
signature; update June
receivership report

06/05/13 C. Parsons June, 2013; review monthly cash 0.25 135.00 33.75
report prepared by T Stewart

06/05113 C. Parsons May,2013: bank reconciliation 1.00 135.00 135.00
and general ledger adjustments

06/05/13 C. Parsons Parkway Pawn" May, 2013: bank 0.25 135.00 33.15
reconciliation

06/07/13 T. Stewart Enter invoices to be paid, print 0.50 \35.00 67.50
checks, copy, assemble for
signature, mail

06/10/13 T. Stewart Print 4/30/13 court report AJE 0.25 135.00 33.75
reports and supporting documents
for C Parsons

06/I1I13 T. Stewart Munsch and UHY payables 0.33 135.00 44.55

Total Services 6,920.55

Subtotal for engagement 0036278-0002 $fi,22[t5.5
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Invoice No: 1047003
Date: June 15,2013
Engagement #: 0036278-0002

SERVICES DETAIL

Select Asset Fund I: 0036278-0006

DATE STAFF SERVICE HRS RATE AMOUNT

06/04113 T. Stewart Balance intercompany accounts o.n 135.00 22.95

06/05/13 C. Parsons MaY,2013: bank reconciliation 0.50 135.00 67.50
and general ledger adjustments

Total Services 90.45

Subtotal for engagement 0036278-0006

SERVICES DETAIL

Select Asset Prime Index Fund: 0036278-0007

DATE STAFF SERVICE HRS RATE AMOUNT

06/04/13 T. Stewart Balance intercompany accounts 0.17 135.00 22.95

06/05/13 C. Parsons May,2013: bank reconciliation 0.50 135.00 67.50
and general ledger adjustments

Total Services 90.45

Subtotal for engagement 0036278-0007
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UHY Advisors TX, LLC
2929 Allen Parkway, 20" Floor
Houston, Texas 77019-7100

phone: 713-960-1706
Toll Free: 800-949-1706
Web: www.uhy-us.com

Mr. Steven A. Harr, Receiver
Munsch Hardt Kopf & Harr PC
700 Louisiana Street, Suite 4600
Houston, Texas 77002-2845

Invoice No: 1050433
Date; July 15,2013

Engagement #: 0036278-0011

INVOICE

RE: 1. David Financial Group et al "Tax Services"

Professional services rendered in connection with J. David Group et al receivership for the period
June 16,2013 to July 15,2013

(See Attached Detail)
Total Amount Due This Invoice __Jil31 .25

SUMMARY BY ENGAGEMENT (PROJECT)

bn!;ugement # Engagement Name Amount

0036278-0011 J. David Financial Group et al Receivership $131.25

WIRING INSTRUCTIONS:
UHY Advisors, Inc.
Charter One Blink I RBS Citizens Bank
1Citizens Drive, Riverside, RI 02915
Account Number: 4516302380
ABA: 241070417
Swift Number for International Wires: CTZmS33

REMITTANCE ADDRESS
UHY Advisors TX. LLC
Dept CH16401
Palatine.Tl, 60055-6401

Place your engagement number on your check * Our Federal Tax LD. # is 76-0522558
This invoice may be kept for your records -- Thank you
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SERVICES DETAIL

J. David Financial Group et al Receivership: 0036218-0011

DATE
07/01113

STAFF

L. Waters

SERVICE

Conference call w/Amy & Jesse
regarding initial distributions (tax
reserves, partner capital accounts,
etc.)

Total Services

Subtotal for engagement 0036278-0011

HRS

0.75

RATE

175.00

AMOUNT

131,25

131.25
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UHY Advisors FL VS, Inc. 2929 Allen Parkway, 20" Floor
Houston, Texas 77019-7100

Phone: 713-960-1706
Toll Free: 800-949-1706
Web: www.uhy-us.com

Mr. Steven Harr, Receiver
Munsch Hardt Kopf & Han- PC
700 Louisiana Street, Suite 4600
Houston, Texas 77002

Invoice No: 1050435
Date: July 15,2013

Engagement #: 0036278-0001

INVOICE

RE: J. David Financial Group et al

Professional services rendered in connection with 1, David Financial Group receivership for the
period June 16,2013 through July 15,2013

(See Attached Detail)

Total Amount Due This Invoice $2,635,00

SUMMARY BY ENGAGEMENT (pROJECT)

Engagement # Engagement Name

1. David Financial Group et aJ

Amount

0036278-000 I $2,635,00

WOONG INSTRUCTIONS:
UHY Advisors, Inc.
Charter One Bank I RBS Citizens Bank
1 Citizens Drive, Riverside, RI 02915
Account Number: 4516302380
ABA: 241070411
Swift Number for International Wires: CTZmS33

REMITTANCE ADDRESS
UHY Advisors FL VS, Inc.
Dept. CmMO}
Palatine, IL 60055--6401

Place your engagement number on your check '" Our Federal Tax LD. # is 20-2703059
This invoice may be kept for your records -- Thank you
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Invoice No: 1050435
Date: July 15, 20J3
Engagement #: 0036278-000 I

SERVICES DETAIL

J. David Group: 0036278-0001

DATE STAFF SERVICE HRS RATE AMOUNT

06/17/13 1. Daves Review of invoices and 0.15 300.00 45.00
coordination of payment.

06/19/13 J. Daves Discussion with counsel 0.25 300.00 75.00
regarding Bjork analysis.

06/20/13 J. Daves Analysis of Bjork data. 1.00 300.00 300.00

06121113 J. Daves Analysis of Bjork data. 1.00 300.00 300.00

06/26/13 J. Daves Review of cash amounts for court 0.35 300.00 105.00
reporting.

06126/13 J. Daves Review of invoices and 0.25 300.00 75.00
coordination of payment.

06/26/13 D. Mundhenk June 2013: Enter bank activity 1.25 80.00 ]00.00
and reconcile bank accounts

06/27/13 1. Daves Prepare wires for payment of 0.20 300.00 60.00
fees.

06/28113 J. Daves Correspondence with team and 0.30 300.00 90.00
counsel regarding available funds
and a potential distribution.

07/01/13 J. Daves Discussions with tax team 0.50 300.00 150.00
regarding potential distributions.

07/01113 J. Daves Conference call with counsel 0.40 300.00 120.00
regarding interim distributions.

07/0]/13 J. Daves Review of analysis and 0.20 300.00 60.00
discussion with counsel regarding
Bjork transactions.

07/09/13 J. Daves Review of documents and 1.50 300.00 450.00
meeting with counsel regarding
interim distribution.

07110/13 J. Daves Review of documents related to 0.50 300.00 150.00
SMIG settlement.

07111/13 1. Daves Review of invoices and 0.35 300.00 105.00
coordination of payment.

07112/13 J. Daves Analysis of data to be considered 0.50 300.00 150.00
for distribution.

07115/13 1. Daves Review of forensic analysis. 1.00 300.00 300.00

Total Services 2,635.00

Subtotal for engagement 0036278-0001 $2!635,flQ

Case 4:11-cv-02830   Document 158-4   Filed in TXSD on 09/20/13   Page 19 of 32



UHY AtMISQI'S FLVS, Ino. 2929 Allen Parkway, 20" Floor
Houston, Texas 77019-7100

Phone: 713-%0-\706
Toll Free: 800-949-1706
Web: www.uhy-us.com

Mr. Steven Harr, Receiver
Munsch Hardt Kopf & Harr PC
700 Louisiana Street, Suite 4600
Houston, Texas 77002

Invoice No: 1050436
Date: July 15, 20 J 3

Engagement #: 0036278-0002
0036278-0006
0036278-0007

INVOICE

RE: 1. David Financial Group et al "Bookkeeping Services"

Professional services rendered in connection with J. David Group et al receivership for the period
June J6, 2013 to July 15,2013

(See Attached Detail)

Total Amount Due This mvoice==="$;J,1"",,5l£8g6,,,2~5

SUMMARY BY ENGAGEMENT (PROJECT)

Engagement # Engagement Name Amount
-------~~--

0036278-0002 J. David Financial Group et al $1,282.50

0036278-0006 Select Asset Fund I $135.00

0036278-0007 Select Asset Prime Index Fund $168.75

WIRING INSTRUCTIONS:
UHY Advisors, Inc,
Charter One Blink {RBS Citizens Balik
1 Citizens Drive, Riverside, RI 02915
Account Number: 4516302380
ABA: 241070417
Swift Number for International Wires: CTZIUS33

REMITTANCE ADDRESS
UHY Advisors FLVS, inc.
Dept, CHl6401
Palanne.H, 60055-6401

Place your engagement number on your check * Our Federal Tax I.D. # is 20-2703059
This invoice may be kept for your records -- Thank you
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Invoice No: 1050436
Date: July 15,2013
Engagement #: 0036278-0002

SERVICES DETAIL

J. David Group: 0036278-0002

DATE STAFF SERVICE HRS RATE AMOUNT

06/19/13 T. Stewart Enter invoices to be paid, print 1.00 135.00 135.00
checks, copy, assemble for
signature; TIC w/City of Pearland
re: late water payment for Apple
Blossom

06/20/13 T. Stewart Enter invoices to be paid, print 0.33 135.00 44.55
checks, copy, assemble for
signature

06/26/13 C. Parsons June, 2013: assist C Wilder with 0.25 135.00 33.75
cash balance update

06/26/13 C. Wilder Cash report to Jesse - discuss 0.50 225.00 112.50
with Dolores

06/28113 C. Wilder Due to/from reports to Jesse 0.35 225.00 78.75

07/01113 A.Hume Read Steve's email and 0.75 300.00 225.00
attachment re: distributions;
telephone conference with L
Waters, J Daves

07/01/13 A.Hume Discuss June deposit source with 0.15 300.00 45.00
J Daves and T Stewart

07/0ll13 C. Parsons Parkway Pawn - June, 2013: 0.25 135.00 33.75
reconcile bank account and
general ledger review

07/0 liB C. Parsons June, 2013: reconcile bank 0.75 135.00 101.25
account and general ledger
adjustments

07/01113 C. Parsons June,2013: review monthly cash 0.25 \35.00 33.75
report prepared by T Stewart

07/01113 T. Stewart Respond to various emails; 1.92 135.00 259.20
prepare July l st recap of
receivership report; work w/C
Parsons re: 4/30113 AJEs

07/02/13 T. Stewart Enter invoices to be paid, print 0.50 135.00 67.50
checks, copy, assemble for
signature, mail

07/12/13 J. Guillott Emails re possible distribution 0.15 300.00 45.00

07/12(13 T. Stewart Enter invoices to be paid, print 0.50 135.00 67.50
checks, copy, assemble for
signature, mail

Total Services 1,282.50

Subtotal for engagement 0036278-0002 $],282,51}
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SERVICES DETAIL

Select As!SetFund I: 0036278-0006

DATE STAFF SERVICE

07/01/13 C. Parsons June,2013: reconcile bank
account and general ledger
adjustments

07/01/13 T. Stewart Balance intercompany accounts

07/08/13 C. Parsons July,2013: post banking activity

Total Services

Subtotal for engagement 0036278-0006

SERVICES DETAIL

Select Asset Prime Index Fund: 0036278-0007

DATE STAFF SERVICE

06/21/13 T. Stewart Enter invoice to be paid, print
check, copy, assemble for
signature

07/0 II 13 C. Parsons June, 2013: reconcile bank
account and general ledger
adjustments

07/0lf13 T. Stewart Balance intercompany accounts

07/08113 C. Parsons July, 2013: post banking activity

Total Services

SUbtotal for engagement 0036278-0007

0.25

0.25

0.50

0.25

0.25

RATE

135.00

135.00

135.00

RATE

135.00

135.00

135.00

135.00

Invoice No: 1050436
Date: July 15,2013
Engagement #: 0036278-0002

AMOUNT

67.50

33.75

33.75

135.00

SiBS,OO

AMOUNT

33.75

67.50

33.75

33.75

168.75

$J68.7$
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UHY Advisors TX, LLC
2929 Allen Parkway. 20'" Floor
Houston, Texas 77019-7100

Phone: 713-960-1706
Toll Free: 800·949-1706
Web: www.uhy-es.corn

Steven A. Harr
Receiver
700 Louisiana Street, Suite 4600
Houston, Texas 77002-2845

Invoice No: 1053901
Date: August 15,2013

Engagement #: 0036278-00 II

INVOICE

RE: J. David Financial Group et al "Tax Services"

Professional services rendered in connection with J. David Group et al receiversh ip for the period
July 16,2013 to August 15,2013

(See Attached Detail)
Total Amount Due This Invoice === .....="$;d7~3.od.7~5_

SUMMARY BY ENGAGEMENT (PROJECT)

Engagement # Engagement Name

J. David Financial Group et al Receivership

Amount

0036278-0011 $73.75

WIRING INSTRUCTIONS:
UHY Advisors, Inc.
Charter One Bank I RBS Citizens Bank
1 Citizens Drive, Riverside, Rl 02915
Account Number: 45163023S0
ABA: 241070417
Swift Number for International Wires; CTZruS33

REMITTANCE ADDRESS
DHY Advisors TX, LLC
Dept CHl6401
Palatine, IL 60055-6401

Place your engagement number on your check * Our Federal Tax 1.0. # is 76-0522558
This invoice may be kept for your records -- Thank you
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SERVICES DETAIL

J. David Financial Group et al Receivership: 0036218-0011

DATE STAFF SERVICE HRS RATE AMOUNT
08/01113 L. Waters Intercompany Balances: discuss 0.25 175.00 43.75

status with Jesse & email
spreadsheet

08/051I3 A.Hume Emails regarding TFTR for J 0.10 300,00 30.00
David Group of Companies

Total Services 73,75

Subtotal for engagement 0036278-0011
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UHY Advisors FLVS, Inc. 2929 Allen Parkway, 20" Floor
Houston, Texas 77019-7100

Phone: 713-960-1706
Toll Free: BOO-949-1706
Web: www.uhy-us.com

Mr. Steven Harr, Receiver
Munsch Hardt Kopf & Harr PC
700 Louisiana Street, Suite 4600
Houston, Texas 77002

Invoice No: 1053910
Date: August 15,2013

Engagement #: 0036278-0001
0036278-0005

INVOICE

RE: 1. David Financial Group et al

Professional services rendered in connection with 1. David Financial Group receivership for the
period July 16, 2013 to August 15, 2013

(See Attached Detail)
Total Amount Due This Invoice $5,893.50

SUMMARY BY ENGAGEMENT (PROJECT)

Engagement # Engagement Name Amount

0036278-000 I

0036278-0005

J. David Financial Group et al

Select Asset Prime Index Fund

$5,773.50

$120.00

WIRING INSTRUCTIONS:
URY Advisors, Inc.
Charter One Bank / RBS Citizens Bank
1Citizens Drive, Riverside, ru 02915
Account Number: 4516302380
ABA: 241070417
Swift Number for International Wires: CTZIUS33

REMITTANCE ADDRESS
UHY Advisors FLVS, Inc.
Dept. CRIM01
Palatine, IL 60055-6401

Place your engagement number on your check * Our Federal Tax J.D. # is 20-2703059
This invoice may be kept for your records -- Thank you

Case 4:11-cv-02830   Document 158-4   Filed in TXSD on 09/20/13   Page 25 of 32

http://www.uhy-us.com


Invoice No: 1053910
Date: August 15,2013
Engagement #: 0036278-0001

SERVICES DETAIL

J. David Group: 0036278-0001

DATE STAFF SERVICE HRS RATE AMOUNT

07/17/13 J. Daves Discussions with team regarding 0.25 300.00 75.00
forensic analysis for distributions.

07/18/13 1. Daves Review of invoices and 0.50 300.00 150.00
coordination of payment.

07/18/13 D. Mundhenk July 2013: Select Asset vendor 0.25 \35.00 33.75
payables

07fl9/13 J. Daves Review of documents from 0.25 300.00 75.00
counseL

07122/13 1. Daves Review of correspondence from 0.50 300.00 150.00
counsel and prepare follow up.

07/22/13 C. Kniepmann 1. David Matter: Reviewed 0.80 140.00 112.00
insurance proceeds
memorandum.

07/23/13 J. Daves Respond to questions from 0.60 300.00 180.00
counsel regarding sale of Apple
Blossom.

07/23/13 C. Kniepmann J. David: Reviewed memo and 0.50 140.00 70.00
data making up tables within
memo.

07/23/13 D. Mundhenk Process online payment 0.25 135.00 33.75

. 07/26/13 C. Kniepmann 1. David: Reviewed related entity 1.00 140.00 140.00
data,

07/29/13 C. Kniepmann J. David - Reviewed related party 2.10 140.00 294.00
transactions.

07/30/13 1. Daves Review of invoices and 0.50 300.00 150.00
coordination of payment.

07/31/13 J. Daves Discussion with team regarding 0.50 300.00 150.00
analysis of transactions between
entities.

07/31/13 C. Kniepmann Reviewed tables and tied to 1.50 140.00 210.00
summary.

08/01113 J. Daves Review of data for transactions 0.50 300.00 150.00
between entities.

08/01113 C. Kniepmann Reviewed and reconciled related 3.50 140.00 490.00
entity data.

08/01113 C. Kniepmann Reviewed memos and filings and 1.50 140.00 210,00
reconciled to tables.

08/01/13 C. Knieprnann Performed reconciliation of 1.20 140.00 168.00
related entity accounts.

08/02/13 C. Kniepmann Performed analysis of related 2.80 140.00 392.00
party transactions.

08/02113 C. Kniepmann Performed analysis and reviewed 2.10 140.00 294.00
related party transactions.
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Invoice No: 1053910
Date: August 15, 2013
Engagement #: 0036278-0001

DATE STAFF SERV1CE HRS RATE AMOUNT

08/05/13 J. Daves Review of correspondence from 0.60 300.00 180.00
counsel and prepare responses
regarding the sale of Apple
Blossom.

08/05/13 J. Daves Discussion with counsel 0.25 300.00 75.00
regarding distribution analysis.

08/05113 C. Kniepmann Reviewed and discussed detailed 0.50 140.00 70.00
related entity data.

08/06/13 J. Daves Review of invoices and 0.25 300.00 75.00
coordination of payment.

08/06/13 J. Daves Respond to counsel regarding 0.35 300.00 105.00
questions on Apple Blossom sale
information.

08/06113 J. Daves Provide information to 0.50 300.00 150.00
accounting team for quarterly
reporting.

08/07113 J. Daves Update calculations for Holley 0.35 300.00 105.00
loan for counsel.

08/07/13 J. Daves Respond to questions from 0.20 300.00 60.00
counsel regarding invoices paid.

08/08/13 J. Daves Review correspondence from 0.25 300.00 75.00
counsel.

08/09/13 J. Daves Review of data for quarterly 0.75 300.00 225.00
reporting.

08/09/13 J. Daves Review of invoices and 0.25 300.00 75.00
coordination of payment.

08/15/13 J. Daves Review of quarterly report and 0.75 300.00 225.00
discussions with accounting
regarding same.

OS/15/13 C. Kniepmann Performed data analysis. 2.70 140.00 378.00

08/15/13 C. Kniepmann Performed data analysis. 3.20 140.00 448.00

Total Services 5,773.50

SUbtotal for engagement 0036278-0001 SS,773...Si!

SERVICES DETAIL

Select Asset Prime Index Fund: 0036278~OOO5

DATE STAFF SERVICE HRS RATE AMOUNT

08/08/13 1. Daves Deposit note payment. 0.40 300.00 120.00

. ... .._- _. -~~~-.---
Total Services 120.00

Subtotal for engagement 0036278-0005 1112!1,O.fi
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____________________________________________________________________________ 
RECEIVER’S SEVENTH INTERIM APPLICATION TO ALLOW AND PAY (1) RECEIVER’S FEES AND EXPENSES, (2) ATTORNEY’S FEES 

AND EXPENSES, AND (3) OTHER PROFESSIONAL FEES AND EXPENSES, AND BRIEF IN SUPPORT - PAGE 13 of 13 
 

 
IN THE UNITED STATES DISTRICT COURT 
FOR THE SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS 

HOUSTON DIVISION 
 
SECURITIES AND EXCHANGE 
COMMISSION, 
 
 Plaintiff, 
 
v. 
 
BRIAN A. BJORK, ESTATE OF JOEL DAVID 
SALINAS, J. DAVID GROUP OF 
COMPANIES, INC., J. DAVID FINANCIAL 
GROUP, L.P., SELECT ASSET 
MANAGEMENT, LLC, SELECT CAPITAL 
MANAGEMENT, LLC, SELECT ASSET 
FUND I, LLC, AND SELECT ASSET PRIME 
INDEX FUND, LLC , 
 
 Defendants. 

§ 
§ 
§ 
§ 
§ 
§ 
§ 
§ 
§ 
§ 
§ 
§ 
§ 
§ 
§ 
§ 
§ 
§ 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
CIVIL ACTION NO. 4:11-cv-2830 

 
ORDER GRANTING SEVENTH INTERIM APPLICATION TO ALLOW AND PAY 

(1) RECEIVER'S FEES AND EXPENSES, (2) ATTORNEY'S FEES AND EXPENSES, AND  
(3) OTHER PROFESSIONAL FEES AND EXPENSES, AND BRIEF IN SUPPORT 

This matter is before the Court on the Receiver’s Unopposed Seventh Interim 

Application to Allow and Pay (1) Receiver’s Fees and Expenses; (2) Attorney’s Fees and 

Expenses; and (3) Other Professional Fees and Expenses (the “Motion”).  The Plaintiff and 

Defendants agree to the relief requested.  The Court is of the opinion that the Receiver’s Motion 

is well-taken and it is GRANTED. 

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that the Receiver’s Seventh Interim Application to Allow and 

Pay Fees and Expenses is GRANTED. 

Signed this ____ day of ____________, 2013. 

_______________________________________ 
HONORABLE KEITH P. ELLISON 
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